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#2 #5 #57 #6 #78 #8 #810 #7 TYPE A TYPE B
SURGE 
ROCK #89

Rogers Group Inc.     
Huntsville, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

C.A. Langford Co. Inc. 
Guntersville, AL $19.45 $19.45 $19.45 $19.95 $20.35 $21.00 $18.35 $20.35 $18.95 $18.95 $19.05 $21.00

Vulcan Materials Company 
Guntersville, AL $20.15 $20.30 $20.30 $20.55 $21.55 $21.55 $19.65 $21.55 $19.40 $19.40 $20.00 $21.90

$19.00 $19.00 $19.00 $19.00

MARSHALL COUNTY COMMISSION

BID TABULATION FOR BID #14 - 25
COARSE AGGREGATE (FOB PLANT)

GUNTERSVILLE  AL  35976

$16.00 $15.50 $16.00 $23.00

     Awarded 9/10/2025

424 BLOUNT AVENUE

                                                                                                                                          CRUSHER RUN

BID OPENING DATE:   2:00 PM    SEPTEMBER 2, 2025

BID PRICES  (PER TON)

$21.00 $23.00 $16.00 $21.00
Grayson Carter & Son Inc.                      

Athens, AL  
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